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This semi-detached house seamlessly blends modern design
and architectural details, creating a lifestyle of comfort,
privacy, and sophistication. Located in the prestigious area of ​​
Sierra Blanca, right at the foot of La Concha mountain, you
can enjoy panoramic views of the Mediterranean coast. The
interior is surrounded by thoughtful details, elegant
furnishings and bespoke features that combine practical
living with aesthetic design, including a private wine cellar, a
discreetly hidden laundry room, an exceptional walk-in closet
and a private golf simulator, which can easily be converted
into a private cinema.

MEISHO HILLS 204



Spread across four levels, all floors are connected by a
private elevator, offering effortless movement from the
ground level to the rooftop terrace. The living space is
distributed over two levels with large and open areas for
socialising, an expansive south-facing terrace with a private
pool and bespoke features. On your private roof terrace you
can enjoy the sunset with stunning views of the coastline, as
well as an outdoor kitchen and jacuzzi for relaxation. The
lower level has a private golf simulator that can easily be
converted into a cinema room or games room, as well as a
garage for 3 cars with additional storage space.

Awarded the prestigious Bentley Award for Best Architecture,
Meisho Hills is a testament to luxury living. This gated
community of just 58 private homes features 24-hour
security, two communal swimming pools and three private
spas with saunas, Turkish baths, heated indoor pool and gym.



BEDS 3

3 + 1 

500 m²

800 m²

556 € / Year

BATHS

BUILT

3.995.000 €

MEISHO HILLS 204

3 821 € / YearIBI

COMMUNITY FEE

GARBAGE TAX

TOTAL SURFACE

1 333 € / Month



FEATURES

LUXURIOUS SPA FACILITIES

ROOFTOP TERRACE

PRIVATE HEATED POOL 

CLOSE TO AMENITIES 

PRIVATE GOLF SIMULATOR

PANORAMIC VIEWS

OUTDOOR KITCHEN

WINE ROOM 

BARBEQUE

24H GATED COMMUNITY





























MODERN ELEGANCE WITH PANORAMIC VIEWS IN PRESTIGIOUS SIERRA BLANCA

MEISHO HILLS 204 










